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Intake Form and Contract
15 messages

Tara Sexton <tara@protectingusall.com> Fri, Feb 17, 2017 at 12:38 PM

To: [kwier@gmail.com
Cc: Bryce Cook <bryce@protectingusall.com>

Jade,

Attached please find the intake form and contract that we need you to fill out and sign. Once completed, please return to
our office, along with any pertinent documents that you have in your possession regarding the case.

If you have any questions, please let me know.

Tara Sexton
Ford & Cook, PLC
404 S. Main St.| Jonesboro, AR 72401

P: (870) 935-5400|F: (870) 935-7154

FORD & COOK, PLC

PROTECTING AL L
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2 attachments

-D Intake.pdf
256K

-D Cook- Contract.pdf
128K

Linda Wier <lkwier@gmail.com> Fri, Feb 17, 2017 at 1:02 PM
To: Jade P <jadegim72@gmail.com>

[Quoted text hidden]
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2 attachments

ﬂ Intake.pdf
256K

ﬂ Cook- Contract.pdf
128K

Linda Wier <lkwier@gmail.com> Fri, Feb 17, 2017 at 1:04 PM

Draft To: Jade P <jadeglm72@gmail.com>

Thank you Tara - | forwarded to Jade.
[Quoted text hidden]

Linda Wier <lkwier@gmail.com> Fri, Feb 17, 2017 at 1:07 PM

To: Tara Sexton <tara@protectingusall.com>

Thank you! | forwarded emails to Jade Cook - jadegim72@gmail.com.
Have a blessed day!

Linda Wier
407.920.6629
[Quoted text hidden]

Linda Wier <lkwier@gmail.com> Fri, Feb 17, 2017 at 2:46 PM
To: Tara Sexton <tara@protectingusall.com>

Hi Tara,

Jade text me and said you would be refunding my 1000$. What happened? Why? | can't get a hold of her and I'm

worried:(

Please let me know what's going on.
Kindest Regards,
Linda Wier

On Fri, Feb 17, 2017 at 12:38 PM, Tara Sexton <tara@protectingusall.com> wrote:
[Quoted text hidden]

Linda Wier <lkwier@gmail.com> Wed, Feb 22, 2017 at 7:11 AM

To: Tara Sexton <tara@protectingusall.com>

Trying to better understand how long it's going to take you to refund my 1000$
Jade said Mr.Cook would not be able to help and since he couldn't help he was to refund 1000$

| need a response from you please as to what to expect with this refund.

Taking the 1000$ prevented us from getting someone to help with at least filing continence based on fact Jade couldn't
get approval quick enough from probation officer to travel.

Please advise.

Kindest regards
Linda wier
[Quoted text hidden]

Tara Sexton <tara@protectingusall.com> Wed, Feb 22, 2017 at 9:18 AM

To: Linda Wier <lkwier@gmail.com>

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0?ik=b18b645c94 &view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f%3A1559602782750035380&simpl=msg-f%3A15596027827 ...

2/4


https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0?ui=2&ik=b18b645c94&view=att&th=15a4d3d7031bfc4d&attid=0.1&disp=attd&realattid=b68d0920be97592c_0.1&safe=1&zw
https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0?ui=2&ik=b18b645c94&view=att&th=15a4d3d7031bfc4d&attid=0.2&disp=attd&realattid=b68d0920be97592c_0.2&safe=1&zw
mailto:jadeglm72@gmail.com
mailto:tara@protectingusall.com

12/12/2020 Gmail - Intake Form and Contract

We were unable to refund the money until it actually appeared in our bank account, which it hadn’t as of yesterday
(due to the holiday I think.) | will have Mr. Cook check this morning and let you know.

[Quoted text hidden]

Linda Wier <lkwier@gmail.com> Fri, Feb 24, 2017 at 7:06 AM
To: Tara Sexton <tara@protectingusall.com>

Good morning!

Was just doing a follow up in regards to 1000$ being returned to my account. That's you so much and | look forward to
your reply.

Kindest Regards

linda

[Quoted text hidden]

Tara Sexton <tara@protectingusall.com> Fri, Feb 24, 2017 at 9:26 AM
To: Linda Wier <lkwier@gmail.com>

We are mailing out a check this morning to you for the full refund.
[Quoted text hidden]

Linda Wier <lkwier@gmail.com> Fri, Feb 24, 2017 at 12:42 PM
To: Tara Sexton <tara@protectingusall.com>

328 lake ave 301b Maitland FL 327517
[Quoted text hidden]

Tara Sexton <tara@protectingusall.com> Fri, Feb 24, 2017 at 1:26 PM
To: Linda Wier <lkwier@gmail.com>

Thank you. It went out with the mail this morning.

[Quoted text hidden]

Linda Wier <lkwier@gmail.com> Thu, Oct 26, 2017 at 11:23 AM
To: IBLAW4673@aol.com

Good Day Jed,

| want to thank you for all that you have done with Ava Wood - Matt Wood and my daughter Jade Cook.
| have forwarded the email of Esqg. Bryce Cook.

May you have a blessed day!
Kindest Regards

Linda Wier
407.920.6629

—————————— Forwarded message ----------

From: Tara Sexton <tara@protectingusall.com>
Date: Fri, Feb 17, 2017 at 12:38 PM

Subject: Intake Form and Contract

To: Ikwier@gmail.com

Cc: Bryce Cook <bryce@protectingusall.com>
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2 attachments

E Intake.pdf
256K

E Cook- Contract.pdf
128K

Linda Wier <lkwier@gmail.com> Thu, Oct 26, 2017 at 11:24 AM

To: IBLAW4673@aol.com

[Quoted text hidden]

Linda Wier <lkwier@gmail.com> Thu, Oct 26, 2017 at 11:24 AM

To: IBLAW4673@aol.com

—————————— Forwarded message ----------
From: Tara Sexton <tara@protectingusall.com>
[Quoted text hidden]

Linda Wier <lkwier@gmail.com> Wed, May 16, 2018 at 2:33 PM

To: creampufftand <creampuffandbacon@gmail.com>, Linda Wier <lkwier@gmail.com>

Mom,

| am sending you this because | feel important to be on timeline. Bryce Cook attorney in Jonesboro Arkansas agreed to
take case in regards to file return order by Judge Michael Murphy. Bryce Cook agreed to take case sent intake forms and
contract for Jade. | made a deposit of 1000$ Within the same day that they accepted 1000$ few hours later the lawyer
contacted Jade and said he could not take her money because no matter the outcome that Judge King was not giving
Ava back to Jade. He refunded my 1000%$ several days later.

Please confirm that you received the emails transpired should be 15 between me and secretary.

Linda

—————————— Forwarded message ----------

From: Tara Sexton <tara@protectingusall.com>
Date: Fri, Feb 17, 2017 at 12:38 PM

Subject: Intake Form and Contract

To: Ikwier@gmail.com

Cc: Bryce Cook <bryce@protectingusall.com>

[Quoted text hidden]

2 attachments

E Intake.pdf
256K

E Cook- Contract.pdf
128K
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